
The Making of a Nation in Kurdish Journalistic
Discourse, 1898–1914: A Comprehensive
Examination
The emergence of Kurdish nationalism in the late 19th and early 20th
centuries was a complex and multifaceted process, influenced by a range
of factors including the rise of European nationalism, the decline of the
Ottoman Empire, and the growing awareness of Kurdish identity among the
Kurdish people. Kurdish journalism played a significant role in the formation
and dissemination of Kurdish nationalist ideas, providing a platform for
Kurdish intellectuals and activists to articulate their aspirations and mobilize
support for their cause.

This article examines the role of Kurdish journalistic discourse in shaping
the making of a Kurdish nation in the period 1898–1914. It analyzes the
content and rhetoric of Kurdish newspapers and magazines published
during this period, and explores the ways in which these publications
contributed to the development of Kurdish national identity and
consciousness.
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The Origins of Kurdish Journalism

The first Kurdish newspaper, Kurdistan, was published in Cairo in 1898 by
the Kurdish intellectual and activist Mikdad Midhat Bedir Khan. Bedir Khan
was a member of the Kurdish elite who had been exiled from his homeland
by the Ottoman authorities. He founded Kurdistan as a platform to promote
Kurdish nationalism and to advocate for the rights of the Kurdish people.

The early Kurdish newspapers and magazines were small-scale
publications, with limited circulation and readership. However, they played
a significant role in the formation of a Kurdish national consciousness. They
provided a forum for Kurdish intellectuals to discuss their history, culture,
and language, and to promote the idea of a united and independent
Kurdistan.

The Development of Kurdish National Identity

The Kurdish newspapers and magazines published in the period 1898–
1914 played a key role in the development of Kurdish national identity.
They published articles on Kurdish history, culture, and language, and
promoted the idea of a shared Kurdish heritage. They also reported on
events in Kurdistan and the wider Middle East, and provided a platform for
Kurdish intellectuals to express their views on political and social issues.

The Kurdish newspapers and magazines also played a role in shaping the
political consciousness of the Kurdish people. They advocated for the rights
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of the Kurdish people, and called for an end to Ottoman oppression. They
also printed articles on the Kurdish question, and debated the best way to
achieve Kurdish independence.

The development of Kurdish national identity was also influenced by the
rise of European nationalism. The Kurdish intellectuals who founded the
first Kurdish newspapers and magazines were inspired by the nationalist
movements in Europe, and they saw their goal as being to create a similar
movement for the Kurdish people.

The Influence of European Nationalism

The Kurdish nationalists were influenced by a number of European
nationalist thinkers, including Mazzini, Garibaldi, and Kossuth. They
believed that the Kurds, like other European nations, had the right to self-
determination and independence. They also believed that the Kurds had a
unique history and culture that distinguished them from the other peoples of
the region.

The influence of European nationalism can be seen in the rhetoric and
content of the Kurdish newspapers and magazines published in the period
1898–1914. These publications frequently invoked the principles of liberty,
equality, and fraternity, and they called on the Kurdish people to unite and
fight for their independence.

The Kurdish Question

The “Kurdish question” refers to the political and social issues facing the
Kurdish people, including their aspirations for self-determination and
independence. The Kurdish question was a major topic of debate in the
Kurdish newspapers and magazines published in the period 1898–1914.



The Kurdish nationalists argued that the Kurds were a distinct nation with
the right to self-determination. They called for the creation of an
independent Kurdistan, and they rejected the idea of Kurdish autonomy
within the Ottoman Empire.

The Ottoman authorities, on the other hand, denied the existence of a
Kurdish nation, and they argued that the Kurds were a part of the Ottoman
nation. They refused to grant the Kurds any form of autonomy, and they
suppressed Kurdish nationalist movements.

The Kurdish question remains unresolved today, and it continues to be a
source of tension in the Middle East.

The Kurdish newspapers and magazines published in the period 1898–
1914 played a significant role in the formation and dissemination of Kurdish
nationalist ideas. They provided a platform for Kurdish intellectuals and
activists to articulate their aspirations and mobilize support for their cause.
They also helped to create a sense of shared Kurdish identity and
consciousness, and they contributed to the development of Kurdish
nationalism.

The Kurdish nationalist movement was ultimately unsuccessful in achieving
its goal of independence, but it left a lasting legacy in the form of a strong
Kurdish national identity. The Kurdish newspapers and magazines
published in the period 1898–1914 were an important part of this legacy,
and they continue to inspire Kurdish nationalists today.
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The Bedtime Story of Love Between Daughter
and Daddy
Once upon a time, there was a little girl named Lily who loved her daddy
very much. Every night, before she went to bed, Lily and...

How to Stop the Aggressive Narcissist: Finding
the Energy to Heal After Any
Understanding the Aggressive Narcissist Aggressive narcissists are
individuals with a heightened sense of entitlement and superiority....
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